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This special issue on Emerging Trends in Inventory, Supply Chain and Reliability 
Modelling, (ETISCRM 2018) presents recent developments in the area of Inventory 
Control, Supply Chain Management, and Reliability Modelling to foster discussion 
among researchers, academicians, industry professional, and scientists. It provides a 
unique focus by linking supply chains with inventory management and reliability 
modelling, with an objective to advance the theory and practice as well as to identify 
major trends and applications in these interdisciplinary areas. The research papers 
included in the special issue comprised of the following areas: 

• Inventory planning and control 

• Production management 

• Interfaces between inventory 

• Management and other areas (Marketing, Finance, etc.) 

• Sustainable management 

• Emerging technology in supply chain 

• Closed-loop supply chain 

• Reverse logistics 

• Operational and strategic issues in inventory control 

• Block chain 

• Global supply chain 

• Humanitarian/disaster management supply chain 

• Supply chain management under risk and uncertainty 

• Software reliability 

Certainly, inventory management strategies aim to minimise costs while ensuring high 
service levels. At the same time, environmental and social aspects of inventory 
management should be considered to jointly ensure sustainability and profitability. 
Further, Supply Chain Management (SCM) is the effective integration to manage all 
possessions and flows for products or services in a distribution channel, which includes 
suppliers, manufacturers, distributors, and customers. SCM has evolved from manual, 
logistical, and mechanisation optimisation to digital and automated integration and 
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coordination of all supply chain elements. It optimises the flows of products, information, 
and finances, allowing companies to create better values and business efficiencies. 
Moreover, when creating new electronic functionalities and/or increasing performance, 
the concerns of reliability and functional safety should be accounted for right from the 
start of development. This avoids wrong choices that otherwise may lead to costly and 
time-consuming repetitions of several development steps or even major parts of the 
development. 

The purpose of this special issue is to collect quantitative articles reflecting the latest 
developments in different fields of inventory, supply chain and reliability modelling.  
The special issue is open to receiving academic and realistic studies on different topics 
related to inventory, supply chain, and reliability modelling. 

Summary of the papers included in the special issue 
The special issue of IJSOI in Emerging Trends in Inventory, Supply Chain and Reliability 
Modelling (ETISCRM 2018) presents 12 quality research papers which mainly focus on 
the recent development of inventory, supply chain and reliability modelling. The first 
paper mainly focuses on sustainable inventory policy for an imperfect production system 
with imperfect rework and defective sales return. The second paper shows the EOQ 
modelling for non-instantaneous deteriorating items with ramp-type demand in a  
two-warehouse facility. In the third paper, the researcher developed a production-
inventory model with price-sensitive demand, volume agility and investment in 
preservation technology. The fourth paper builds up a vendor-buyer inventory model 
when demand is governed by innovation rate under DCF and game theoretical approach. 
The fifth paper develops an EOQ model for freshness and stock dependent demand with 
an expiration date under the cap-and-trade mechanism. The sixth paper deals with an 
EOQ model for non-instantaneous deteriorating items with two storage facilities under 
progressive trade credit policy in the financial environment. The seventh paper builds up 
an intuitionistic fuzzy AHP based reliability allocation model for the multi-software 
system. In the eighth paper, the researcher is trying to investigate the effect of inflation 
on an inventory system for defective items with inspection errors, sales returns and 
shortages. The ninth paper deals with an integrated inventory model for imperfect 
production systems incorporating marketing decisions with an investment in preservation 
technology. In the tenth paper, a concept of block chain is discussed in detail and shown 
how block chain is a pathway to improve performance measures of the supply chain. The 
eleventh paper establishes a relation between production rate and product quality in a 
single-vendor multi-buyer supply chain model. The twelfth paper is doing 
multigenerational modelling incorporating time lag in innovation adoption. 




